Data Protection Officer Freedom of Information NW Leicestershire District Council Whitwick Road Coalville Leicestershire LE67 3FJ

Telephone: 01530 454763

### **ENVIRONMENTAL INFORMATION REGULATION REQUEST 1023**

I write further to your email dated 02 December 2019.

Your request has been dealt with under the terms of the Environmental Information Regulation 2004 (EIR), explained on our Environmental Information Regulation page.

### Your request:

I'm undertaking an environmental assessment for a plot of land north of Burton Road, Measham, Swadlincote DE12.

For the above site I am enquiring if North West Leicestershire Environmental Health Department can provide me with any information you may have on the following:

## Our response:

1. Confirm if the site is considered to be captured under Part II of the EPA, or is on the Council's contaminated land register

Part of the site has been identified as potentially contaminated however there are no appropriate receptors onsite.

- 2. Records of any contaminative uses on the site or on land adjacent to the site

  Part of the site is a landfill site and a filled canal.
- 3. Records of any confirmed contamination on the site (type of contamination, severity of contamination, date of occurrence, any remediation works that have taken place)

The site was investigated and a preliminary investigation was submitted as part of planning permission 13/00141/OUTM. A copy of the investigation is available on the councils public access portal <a href="https://plans.nwleics.gov.uk/public-access/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=MIIOP5LR0FU00">https://plans.nwleics.gov.uk/public-access/applicationDetails.do?activeTab=summary&keyVal=MIIOP5LR0FU00</a>

4. Records of any made ground, infilled ground or landfills on the site (type of made ground or infill, dates of when infilling took place, if landfill gas is a concern)

The landfill site is recorded on the Environment Agency's historic landfill database FID 0
Shape Polygon
DI\_ID HLF1
HLD\_REF EAHLD31313
SITE\_NAME Canal Tip
SITE\_ADD Burton Road, Measham, Leicestershire
EA WMLR

REGIS\_NO

WRC\_REF

**BGS NUM 1289** 

SITE\_REF

LIC\_HOLD

LICHOLDADD

SITEOPNAME Ashby De La Zouch Rural District Council

**SITEOPADD** 

OS\_PREFIX SK

**EASTING 432600** 

**NORTHING 312200** 

EA REGION MI

EA\_AREA Upper Trent MI

LIC\_ISSUE < null>

LIC\_SURREN < null>

FIRSTINPUT 31/01/1963

LASTINPUT 31/12/1971

**INERT** 

**INDUSTRIAL** 

**COMMERCIAL** 

**HOUSEHOLD** 

**SPECIAL** 

LIQSLUDGE

WASTEUNK

**GASCONTROL** 

**LEACHATCNT** 

**EXEMPT** 

**LICENCED** 

**NOLICREQ** 

**BUFF POINT** 

WASTECOM1

WASTECOM2

WASTECOM3

HISTCOM1

HISTCOM2

HISTCOM3

MONITCOM1 MONITCOM2

5. Records of any confirmed pollution incidences on the site (type, impacted receptor, date, severity any remedial action)

The council does not hold this information please refer to the environment agency.

# 6. Any records of ground settlement

The council does not hold this information.

## 7. Any records of type of foundations on the site

The council does not hold this information.

8. Any records regarding the drainage on site, particularly the surface water drainage (presence of interceptors, sumps, any drainage problems flooding or groundwater problems)

The council does not hold this information. Please refer to the local flood authority, Leicestershire county council.

9. Any complaints regarding the site due to odour, noise, nuisance

The council has no complaints regarding the subject site.

10. Any records of buried fuel tanks on the site, if so any information regarding the age, size, number capacity, in use or decommissioned.

The council holds no records regarding the subject site.

11. Any records of archaeology on the site, or any entries on the sites and monuments record.

There are no entries on the councils list of scheduled ancient monuments. For archaeological records please refer to the county archaeologist <a href="https://www.leicestershire.gov.uk/environment-and-planning/planning-archaeology">https://www.leicestershire.gov.uk/environment-and-planning/planning-archaeology</a>.

The supply of information in response to an EIR request does not confer the right to re-use the information. UK copyright law allows information supplied for the purposes of private study and non-commercial research to be used without permission. Information supplied can also be re-used for the purposes of news reporting except for in the case of photographs.

#### **GOING FORWARD**

If you are dissatisfied with the information supplied please feel free to contact me on the number above for any queries in relation to this response. Please note that in responding to further enquiries I can only comment on the information contained within this correspondence and cannot provide any further information that may pertain to an additional EIR request.

Please remember to quote the Authority's four digit reference number given at the top of this email in any future communications.

If you remain dissatisfied following the conclusion of the above informal review, you have the right to ask for an internal review. A request for a review whether formal or informal should be submitted within two calendar months of the date of receipt of the response to your original letter and should be sent to <a href="mailto:DPO@NWLeicestershire.gov.uk">DPO@NWLeicestershire.gov.uk</a> or the address above.

Further details on our appeals and complaints procedure can be found on our website <u>here</u>.

If you remain dissatisfied following the conclusion of the internal review, you have the right to apply directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at <a href="mailto:accessicoinformation@ico.org.uk">accessicoinformation@ico.org.uk</a>.